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All markets: DIGITAL ACESSES
Topic: Local news & events

Priority: HIGH – For your information

SUMMARY

As part of BNP Paribas’ Growth Technology Sustainability (GTS) strategic plan, we leverage technology to further increase our NEOLINK 

WEB Portal service quality and enhance client experience. We are committed to providing state-of-the-art data management and innovative 

digital services..

EFFECTIVE DATE

Starting end of 2024.

ACTION REQUIRED

Further communications will provide more information about upcoming actions.

FULL DETAILS

As part of BNP Paribas’ Growth Technology Sustainability (GTS) strategic plan, we leverage technology to further increase our NEOLINK 

WEB Portal service quality and enhance client experience. We are committed to providing state-of-the-art data management and innovative 

digital services. 

To keep offering a robust access management framework to our digital services whilst complying with regulatory obligations related to anti-

money laundering and financing of terrorism (AML-CFT), we are continuously adapting our policies and procedures.

In that context, starting end of 2024, we will review accesses to our NeoLink web portal through recertification campaigns. These campaigns 



will impact our direct clients as well as their related third parties. In view of this exercise, we will progressively reach out to your appointed 

authorized stakeholders within your organization managing your NeoLink subscription and/or users with the supporting materials and 

guidelines.

REFER TO

If you need further information, please contact your BNP Paribas representative.
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The information contained within this document (‘information’) is believed to be reliable but BNP Paribas does not warrant its completeness or accuracy. Opinions and estimates 
contained herein constitute BNP Paribas’ judgment and are subject to change without notice. BNP Paribas and its subsidiaries shall not be liable for any errors, omissions or 
opinions contained within this document. This material is not intended as an offer or solicitation for the purchase or sale of any financial instrument. For the avoidance of doubt, 
any information contained within this document will not form an agreement between parties. Additional information is available on request.
 
BNP Paribas does not provide tax, legal or accounting advice. This document has been prepared for informational purposes only. It is not intended to provide, and should not be 
relied on for legal, tax, accounting or any other advice. Clients are encouraged to consult their own tax, legal or other professional advisors to understand how this communication 
impacts their particular circumstances.

BNP Paribas is a credit institution that is authorised to perform banking activities and investment services under the law applicable in France and is subject to prudential 
supervision on a consolidated basis by the European Central Bank (ECB), in cooperation with the Autorité de Contrôle Prudentiel et de Résolution (ACPR). As a public listed 
company and as an investment service provider, BNP Paribas is also in France under the supervision of the Autorité des Marchés Financiers (AMF). Its registered office address is 
16 boulevard des Italiens, 75009 Paris, France, and its website is https://group.bnpparibas.
 
BNP Paribas is authorised and regulated by the European Central Bank (ECB) and the Autorité de Contrôle Prudentiel et de Résolution (ACPR). BNP Paribas is authorised by the 
Prudential Regulation Authority (PRA) and is subject to regulation by the Financial Conduct Authority (FCA) and limited regulation by the Prudential Regulation Authority (PRA). 
Details about the extent of our regulation by the Prudential Regulation Authority (PRA) are available from us on request. BNP Paribas London Branch is registered in the UK under 
number FC13447. UK establishment number: BR000170. UK establishment office address: 10 Harewood Avenue, London NW1 6AA.
 
Services described in this document, if offered in the U.S., are offered through BNP Paribas acting through its New York Branch (which is duly authorised and licensed by the 
State of New York Department of Financial Services) or BNP Paribas Financial Services LLC, a limited liability company organised under the laws of the State of Delaware; if a 
securities product, through BNP Paribas Securities Corp., which is a broker-dealer registered with the Securities and Exchange Commission (SEC) and a member of the Securities 
Investor Protection Corporation (SIPC) and the Financial Industry Regulatory Authority (FINRA); or if a futures product through BNP Paribas Securities Corp., a Futures 
Commission Merchant registered with the Commodities Futures Trading Commission (CFTC) and a member of the National Futures Association (NFA).
 
In accordance with the General Data Protection Regulation (GDPR), European Regulation no. 2016-679, depending on the nature of the processing of the personal data concerned, 
you have a right of access, rectification and erasure of your personal data together with the right to restrict or object to the processing of such data. For more information on the 
General Data Protection Regulation (GDPR), details regarding processing purposes, and data retention principles, as well as your rights in relation to the processing of your 
personal data by BNP Paribas SA, in the context of Securities Services activities, please refer to our data protection notice: https://cib.bnpparibas/data-protection-notice/.
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